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BCWS Documentary Application 

Please fill out the below application form and submit to bcws.video@gov.bc.ca. Applications will 
be reviewed by an internal panel to assess feasibility.  

*Disclaimer: funding for independent film projects is not applicable to this application form.

IDENTIFICATION 

Project name 

Project description 

Name of project lead 

Contact information of 

project lead 

Production company 

PROJECT GOALS 

Outline your desired 

outcome (themes/goal) 
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Outline project deliverables 
(number of products, 
product length) 

Describe how this project 
benefits the taxpayers of 
B.C.?

PROJECT INFORMATION 

Target audience 

Estimated budget 

Funding sources 

Channel/s 

Timeline for filming and 
production 

Deadline 
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Personnel desired  
(ie: access to camp, fireline, 
fire centre, Zoom interviews 
etc.)  
 

  

Previous firefighting 
experience/training or 
filming firefighting 
experience  

  

Content ownership 
 
Please outline if any raw 
footage may be shared with 
BCWS for public education, if 
BCWS will have an 
opportunity to review 
footage/interviews etc., and 
which agency or individual 
will maintain ownership of 
footage. 
 

  

Partners or additional 
agencies involved 
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Background or additional 
materials  
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